
SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F3998940008                                                                                                                                              Date: May 21, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, FARM TRACTORS AND FARM IMPLEMENTS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

R.E. Walsh
or R.A.
Walsh

Lubbers &
Sons

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Robert A.
Carlson

Tom Baley
American

Waste

Jim Comoy Circle R
Farms

Al Witvoet
& Sons

Waco
Farms

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

SO9880 $911.27 $112.50 $1,011.00 NO BID NO BID $1,010.00 NO BID $620.00 $600.00 $301.00 NO BID $1,377.00

SO9890 $777.77 $112.50 $1,012.00 $1,010.00 x $750.00 $301.00 $1,177.00

SO9904 $837.11 x $663.00 $876.00 x $1,800.00 $301.00 $967.00

SO9923 $11.77 x x x x x x x

14550 $117.11 x x x x $150.00 X $467.00

14566 $31.77 x x $36.00 x x x $127.00

14565 $31.77 x x $61.00 x x $101.00 $127.00

10F $1.07 x x x x x x x

13F $1.07 x x x x x x x

1F $6.17 x x $106.00 x $50.00 x x

2F $31.77 x x $81.00 x $300.00 x $367.00

3F $1.07 x x $26.00 x $50.00 x $37.00

4F $31.77 $51.00 X $361.00 x $300.00 $401.00 $477.00

5F $1.07 x x $51.00 x x x $37.00

6F x x x x x x x x

7F $57.11 x x $66.00 x x $25.00 $57.00

8F $1.07 x x x x x x x



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F3998940008                                                                                                                                              Date: May 21, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, FARM TRACTORS AND FARM IMPLEMENTS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

9F $26.77 x x x x x x $367.00

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 2 Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

R.E. Walsh
or R.A.
Walsh

Lubbers &
Sons

Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

Robert A.
Carlson

Tom Baley
American

Waste

Jim Comoy Circle R
Farms

Al Witvoet
& Sons

Waco
Farms

Richards
Auto Sales

Derby Hill
Equipment

16F $61.77 x x x x x $301.00 $267.00

10F x x x x x x x x

13F $6.07 x x x $320.00 X x $127.00

1451 $11.07 x x $56.00 x x x x



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F3998940008                                                                                                                                              Date: May 21, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, FARM TRACTORS AND FARM IMPLEMENTS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 3 T&S Auto 
Anthony
Howell

WISCAN True-Line
Inc.

Joe E.
Schafer

A & M
Auto Sales

SO9880 $265.00 $381.59 $422.00 $1,526.00 $2,778.00

SO9890 $250.00 $381.59 $422.00 $1,876.00 $2,886.00

SO9904 $350.00 x $902.00 $525.00 $2,051.00

SO9923 x x $42.00 X X

14550 x x $51.00 x $436.00

14566 x x x x $118.00

14565 x x $46.00 x $116.00

10F x x $67.00 x X

13F x x x x X

1F x x $51.00 x $268.00

2F x x $51.00 x $386.00

3F x x $27.00 x $216.00

4F x x $76.00 x $388.00

5F x x x x X

6F x x x x X

7F x x $102.00 x $312.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F3998940008                                                                                                                                              Date: May 21, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, FARM TRACTORS AND FARM IMPLEMENTS

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

8F x x x x X

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 4 T&S Auto 
Anthony
Howell

WISCAN True-Line
Inc.

Joe E.
Schafer

A & M
Auto Sales

9F x x x x $138.00

16F x $187.59 $205.00 x $386.00

10F x x x x X

13F x x x x $86.00

1451 x x $76.00 x $106.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


