From: @usdoj.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 21, 2019 10:45 AM

To: Steve Berlin <Steve.Berlin@cityofchicago.org>
Subject: RE: Travel Oct. 17-19

Good Morning,

| have returned from Indianapolis on Oct 19, 2019. | traveled in an official capacity. All travel expenses
were paid for by the DOJ.

From:

@usdoj.gov>

Tuesday, October 15, 2019 9:43 AM

To: Steve Berlin <Steve.Berlin@cityofchicago.org>
Subject: Indianapolis Travel Oct. 17-19

Good morning,

| have a travel arrangements planned to Indianapolis, IN. regarding active federal investigations
from 170CT19-190CT19 . All travel expenses will be paid for by the ATF, Dept. of Justice.

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.
Thank you in advance,

ATF Task Force Officer — Chicago Police
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