Specification Number: F2998940006

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE

SALVAGE TABULATION

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Date: May 31, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG.1 Action Iron Lubbers & Derby Hill Richards Auto Andy’s Vintage Al Witvoet T&B Trucks & DC SALES, A-
& Metal Son Equipment Auto Sales Wholesalers E;Llljgrlfng‘]t Vef;)ia(j’ltef & & Sons Cartage Parts of Ohio INC. REA_Llﬁ"(BSL E
PARTS
1) AC8908 X X X $561.00 NO BID X NO BID X $675.81 X X $375.00
2) AC8909 $101.00 X X $361.00 $239.00 X $556.71 X X $375.00
3) CB0006 $50.00 X X $76.00 X X X X X $105.00
4) DT7001 X $510.00 | $1,558.00 X $889.00 X X $369.00 X $55.00
5) FDC800 $550.00 X $210.00 $629.00 $450.00 $657.36 X X $355.00
6) FDC812 $550.00 X X $165.00 $629.00 $450.00 $755.66 X X $355.00
7) FDC830 $605.00 X X $275.00 $729.00 X $655.85 X X $355.00
8) FDC831 $605.00 X X $310.00 $639.00 $425.00 $775.52 X X $355.00
9) FDC841 $701.00 X X $210.00 $729.00 X $755.60 X X $355.00
10) FDC859 $701.00 X X $426.00 $839.00 $650.00 $751.26 X X $355.00
11) FDC872 $701.00 X X $555.00 $889.00 $525.00 $856.81 X X $355.00
12) FMO101 $75.00 X X $20.00 X X X X X $255.00
13) HSO106 $75.00 X X $10.00 X X X X X $255.00
14) S10074 X X X X $869.00 $1,200.00 | $1,157.41 | $569.00 X $300.00
15) S11778 X X X X $1,789.00 $1,275.00 | $1,251.80 | $3,169.00 X $300.00
16) S13128 $800.00 X $7,768.00 X $3,269.00 $3,250.00 X $3,169.00 | $1,400.00 | $300.00




Specification Number: F2998940006

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE

SALVAGE TABULATION

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Date: May 31, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG. 2 Actionlron | Lubbers& Derby Hill Richards Auto Andy’'s Vintage Al Witvoet T&B Trucks& DC SALES, A-
& Metal Son Equipment | AutoSales | Wholesaler Truck & Vehicles & & Sons Cartage Parts of INC. REA—&?%'-E
S Equipment Parts Ohio PARTS
17) S14394 X X $237.00 X NO BID $529.00 NO BID $350.00 $205.00 X X X
18) PNOO11 $165.00 X X $410.00 X X $371.52 X X $125.00
19) PV2074 X X X $366.00 X X $175.57 X X $125.00
20) S13120 X X $2,768.00 X $2,869.00 $3,500.00 $2,176.00 $3,669.00 $1,400.00 $255.00




Specification Number: F2998940006

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

SALVAGE TABULATION

Date: May 31, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG.3 Airline Ideal Cozzi lron | Saeed Auto
AutoEnt. & Metal Sales
Inc.

1) AC8908 X $1,069.00 $50.00 $255.00
2) AC8909 X $1,069.00 | $150.00 $255.00
3) CB0006 X X $50.00 $77.00
4) DT7001 $300.00 X $100.00 X

5) FDC800 X $269.00 $70.00 $156.00
6) FDC812 X $269.00 $60.00 $351.00
7) FDC830 X $269.00 $60.00 $355.00
8) FDC831 X $269.00 $60.00 $155.00
9) FDC841 X $369.00 $60.00 $255.00
10) FDC859 X $369.00 $60.00 $351.00
11) FDC872 X $369.00 $60.00 $155.00
12) FMO101 X $129.00 $50.00 $137.00
13) HSO106 X $129.00 $50.00 $127.00
14) S10074 X X $300.00 $127.00
15) S11778 X X $200.00 X




Bid Deposit: $ NONE

Specification Number: F2998940006

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

SALVAGE TABULATION

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Date: May 31, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG. 4 Airline Ideal Cozzi Iron Saeed Auto
AutoEnt. & Metal Sales
Inc.

16) 513128 X X $200.00 X

17) S14394 X X $20.00 X

18) PNOO11 X $829.00 $45.00 $355.00
19) PV2074 X $269.00 $30.00 $127.00
20) S13120 X X $300.00 X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago

Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer




