

SALVAGE BID TABULATION

Specification Number: F0998940006

Date: May 3, 2000



Project Description: For Sale Twenty-One (21) Various Used Vehicles

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum

Contract Administrator: J. Piel

Name of Bidder (Pg 1)	N. IL Realty	Derby Hill	Al Witvoet	Auto Wholes.	RichardAuto	Vintage Veh.	Ed Kus	Airline Tow.	EDIA Auto	Illiana Trck.	G. Gonzales	J. Dziejic
1. RVP941	X	NO BID	X	NO BID	\$60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$170.00	\$126.00	X	Rejected	Rejected
2. SO3300	X	X	X	X	\$50.00	X	X	\$110.00	X	X	No Signature	Np Signature
3. SO3501	X	X	X	X	\$50.00	X	X	\$111.00	X	X	X	X
4. SO3530	X	X	X	X	\$50.00	X	X	\$160.00	\$106.00	X	X	X
5. SO3605	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$156.00	X	X	X
6. FM0122	X	X	X	X	\$60.00	X	X	\$225.00	\$126.00	X	X	X
7. FM2012	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$75.00	\$126.00	X	X	X
8. GS1231	\$369.99	X	X	X	\$55.00	X	X	\$211.00	\$205.00	X	X	X
9. HS3407	\$369.99	X	X	X	\$40.00	X	X	X	\$76.00	X	X	X
10. INSPG9	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
11. RV0101	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$211.00	\$56.00	X	X	X
12. RV0109	X	X	X	X	\$50.00	X	X	\$150.00	\$241.00	X	X	X
13. SO3814	X	X	X	X	\$40.00	X	X	\$290.00	X	X	X	X
14. SO3865	X	X	X	X	\$40.00	X	X	\$275.00	X	X	X	X
15. DT1510	X	X	\$2,156.43	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X
16. DT1524	X	X	\$1,750.52	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X
17. DT1525	X	X	\$2,040.35	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X
18. 10861	X	X	\$1,236.30	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X
19. 10883	X	X	\$1,050.52	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X
20. 10885	X	X	\$1,465.60	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X
21. 11336	X	X	\$856.40	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$755.00	X	X

SALVAGE BID TABULATION

Specification Number: F0998940006

Date: May 3, 2000



Project Description: For Sale Twenty-One (21) Various Used Vehicles

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Piel

Name of Bidder (Pg 2)	Gutenschwag	Erickson	Parks Cons	Mr. D's Tow								
1. RVP941	\$359.00	X	X	X								
2. SO3300	X	X	X	X								
3. SO3501	X	X	X	X								
4. SO3530	\$160.00	X	X	X								
5. SO3605	\$150.00	X	X	X								
6. FM0122	\$459.00	X	X	X								
7. FM2012	\$359.00	X	\$155.55	X								
8. GS1231	\$609.00	X	X	X								
9. HS3407	\$409.00	X	\$205.55	X								
10. INSPG9	X	X	X	X								
11. RV0101	\$159.00	X	X	X								
12. RV0109	\$209.00	X	X	X								
13. SO3814	\$309.00	X	X	X								
14. SO3865	X	X	X	X								
15. DT1510	X	\$3,657.00	X	X								
16. DT1524	X	\$4,277.00	X	\$1,050.00								
17. DT1525	X	\$3,277.00	X	\$800.00								
18. 10861	X	\$2,307.00	X	X								
19. 10883	X	\$4,137.00	X	X								
20. 10885	X	\$3,157.00	X	X								
21. 11336	X	\$1,857.00	X	X								

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer