
SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940011                                                                                                                                                    Date: August 28, 2000

Project Description: Salvage of (28) Twenty-Eight Vehicles

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder          Pg. 1 Illiana Truck Erickson Vintose Al Wituoct John Wright DC Sales Cozzi Iron Ed Kus Sharon L. Derby Hill Auto Whole. Edca Auto

1)   DT1519 $508.00 $3,667.00 NO BID $1,750.00 X X $200.00 NO BID X X NO BID X

2)   EC0008 X $4,307.00 $1,250.00  X  X $200.00 X X X

3)   EC0004 X $5,307.00 $1,325.00 X X $200.00 X X X

4)   C773 $358.00 $837.00 X X X $40.00 X X X

5)   295 X X X X X $30.00 X X $55.00

6)   283 X X X X X $30.00 X X X

7)   A255 X X X X X $30.00 X X $10.00

8)   DT0116 $358.00 $207.00 $950.75 X X $40.00 $410.25 X $75.00

9)   SO3828 $308.00 X $410.10 X X $30.00 X X $100.00

10) SO3880 $308.00 X $299.09 X X $30.00 X X $75.00

11)  A300 X X X X X $30.00 X X $75.00

12) C860 $558.00 $1,137.00 $575.00 X X $40.00 X X X

13) C722 $308.00 $907.00 $650.00 X X $40.00 X X X

14) C862 $558.00 $1,137.00 $650.00 X X $40.00 X X X

15) C864 $558.00 $1,157.00 $750.00 X X $40.00 X X X

16) A325 X X X X X $30.00 $408.50 X X

17) C887 $608.00 $1,337.00 $525.00 X X $40.00 X X X

18) A306 X X X X X $30.00 X X X

19) 3806 $308.00 X $310.00 X X $30.00 X X $50.00

20) BH0046 $108.00 $127.00 X X X $35.00 $609.75 X $688.00



SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940011                                                                                                                                                    Date: August 28, 2000

Project Description: Salvage of (28) Twenty-Eight Vehicles

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder            Pg. 2 Illiana Truck Ericks   Vintose Al Wituoct John Wright DC Sales Cozzi Iron Ed Kus Sharon L. Derby Hill Auto Whole. Edca Auto

21) CS3912 - GS0172 $258.00 $637.00 NO BID $110.00 X X $30.00 NO BID X X NO BID X

22) C776 $308.00 $807.00 $375.00 X X $40.00 X X X

23) 12029 X $5,617.00 $700.00 $400.00 X       $65.00     X X X

24) 13121 X $14,257.00 $5,550.56   X $14,266.00 $200.00 X $8,567.00 X

25) SO3883 $308.00 X $250.10 X X $30.00 X X $125.00

26) SO3802 $308.00 X $275.25 X X $30.00 X X $100.00

27) SW0013 X X X X X $30.00 $78.10 X $150.00

28) GS3900 $258.00 $107.00 $210.50 X X $30.00 $408.50 X $256.00



SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940011                                                                                                                                                    Date: August 28, 2000

Project Description: Salvage of (28) Twenty-Eight Vehicles

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder         Pg. 3 Al Gutensch. Jose C. T & B Cartage

1)   DT1519 X X REJECTED

2)   EC0008 X X

3)   EC0004 X X

4)   C773 $778.00 X

5)   295 X X

6)   283 X X

7)   A255 X X

8)   DT0116 $1,018.00 X

9)   SO3828 $258.00 X

10) SO3880 $258.00 $400.00

11)  A300 X X

12) C860 $1,018.00 X

13) C722 X X

14) C862 X X

15) C864 X X

16) A325 X X

17) C887 X X

18) A306 X X

19) 3806 $258.00 X

20) BH0046 $658.00 X

Name of Bidder          Pg. 4 Al Gutensch. Jose C. T & B Cartage



SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940011                                                                                                                                                    Date: August 28, 2000

Project Description: Salvage of (28) Twenty-Eight Vehicles

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

21) CS3912 - GS0172 $658.00 X REJECTED

22) C776 $558.00 X

23) 12029 X X

24) 13121 X X

25) SO3883 $258.00 X

26) SO3802 $308.00 X

27) SW0013 X X

28) GS3900 $558.00 X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago   Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies
Richard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


