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Date: September 17, 2008
To: Jody P. Weis
Superintendent of Police

Department: Chicago Police Department

From: \/L/ ﬂ%?7/\/ / j%%’——\

Montel M. Gayles
Chief Procurement Officer

Re: Emergency Contract for Gun Supplies
Vendor Name: Streicher's Police Equipment

Vendor Number: 1064272 Amount: $ 176,769.50

PO Number: 18296 RX Number: 40051
Pursuant to Section 2-92-644 of the Municipal Purchasing Act, | concur
with your request and authorize an Emergency Contract. Based on the

documentation received from your office, it is determined that this
procurement is necessary to meet bona fide operating emergency.

You are hereby authorized to purchase Gun Supplies in the amount of

$ 176,769.50 from Streicher’s Police Equipment as requested in your
letter dated August 21, 2008. Any amount in excess of the $ 176,769.50
approved here will be subject to additional authorization and will be
limited so as not to exceed the $250,000.00 limit established by statute.

MMG/lerf

cc: Montei M. Gayles
Judy Martinez
Gustavo Giraldo
Elvia Fernandez
Molly Longanecker - CPD
Scan
File (Specification No: 68735 /PO No0:18296 )
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RE: Emergency Purchase of Carbines and Related Equipment ?///t)—/

To:  Montel Gayles
Chief Procurement Officer
Procurement Services

From: Jody P. Weis
Superintendent of Police

Date: August 21, 2008

This memorandum is in response to your request for information on the
Chicago Police Department's emergency purchase request for carbines
and related equipment.

As you are aware, the Chicago Police Department has implemented a
Police Carbine Program. | directed the Department to undertake this effort
as quickly as could be done in a safe and effective manner, after
discovering the insufficient capabilities of our first responding officers to
many life threatening events. The high level of violence that is being
directed on the streets of the City against both our citizens and our
officers, as well as the possibility of active shooters in schools, work
places and other public venues clearly mandates that this program be
implemented as soon as possible.

| further directed our Department to ensure that we thoroughly research all
of the carbines and equipment, to ensure that the very best and most
appropriate equipment was ordered and that the cost was at or below
what would be expected. | am now satisfied that we have selected the
best and most appropriate equipment for the Department and the City of
Chicago.

Our officers frequently face life and death confrontations in which their
handguns are inadequate. This summer, our officers’have come under
fire and have been pinned down, in cases where the presence of the
carbines could have given them the tactical advantage. In other
situations, officers have come under heavy and sustained fire and it was
through the effective use of the carbine that the threat was neutralized; in
one instance two officers were shot — one in the chest — and it was a direct
result of the use of carbines that more officers were not injured, and
citizens were protected. These instances reflect the level of gun violence
throughout much of the city, which threatens not only our officers but the
citizens of Chicago. Our officers understand that they are outgunned and
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they are demanding the carbines to protect themselves and to carry out
their mission.

T We have completely revised our plans for active shooter .incidents: which
Richard M. Daley, Vayor require a more effective role from our first responding officers. This can
Chictipd Plice Department only pe carried out py officers who are'armed with 'c'arbines. Tr_\ere iS no
e quegtlon that the ability to protect the Il\{es of the citizens of Chicago
SupiarTidndenEs ) pulie against armed offenders will be greatly mcreg_sed with 'the presence of
0 St M e carbines. Every day that we delay puts our citizens at increased risk.
hicago. Hinors 60633

?:h;'; ,“éb—‘«h\:,‘) Accordingly, | am seeking two emergency purchase orders for this

s At & i iicnntire program. One order represents the carbines and the second order

represents all of the related equipment, including the vehicle gun Iocké,
training equipment and safety equipment. All of these items are required
in order to safely implement the Police Carbine Operator’'s Program. .

Each day that we delay puts the safety and welfare of our officers and our

citizens in jeopardy. Accordingly, | am requesting your assistance to
approve the emergency purchases for this program.
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4777 N. 124th Street
\] Milwaukee, WI 53007
S SJERS  rio consnn
Toll Free (800) 541-4164
Fax (866) 856-5799

Email: jimr@streichers.com

QUOTATION

BILL TO: Chicago P Police Department Date: 71152008
_Quantitv Part # Description Cost Extended
2 78-7528 Bushnel! Spotting Scope -20 x 60 x 80 mm 395.00 $ 790.00
2 78-3001 1 Bushnell Field Tripod 30.00 s 60.00
15 Snap Caps A-Zoom products, .223 Cal. (2 per pack ) 8.00 $ 600.00
10 Rings -FSA4 Training Guns BLUE 139.00 $ 1,390.00
4 CR 200 Discrimination Targets - Starter kit NO BID NO BID
2 20-1916 Bushnell Laser Range Finder 180.00 5 380.00
5 SMM1285X Rock River CAR A2 9MM Carbine NO BID NO BID
10 A1SM Eberlestock Magic Carpet Shooting Mat 79.85 b3 799.50
10 ARCO1M Airsoft Rifle NO BtD NO BID
10 PN-K1807NC Battery Pack for Airsoft Rifle NO BID NO BID
10 10085 Universal Smart Peak Battery Charge NO BID NO BID
25 SDMASK2 Scott Face Mask NO BID NO BID
20 p202M 30 Round magazine for Airsoft Rifle NO BID NO BID
2 21TA-SH _ 100% Silicone Spray Lube NO BID NO BID
1 21TA25GC 25g Trainging Rounds NO BID NO BID
600 Santa Cruz SC Series Mounts and Gunlocks - SC-9178 11135 |$ 6681000
included: all mounting hardware, all required efectronic hardware & deiivery $ -
100 312003 & FT-DCH | 5&4W M&P Flat Top Upper W/DPMS Carry handie FT-DCH 550.00 $ $5,000.00
100 LR-08 DPMS Selector Lever 4.99 g 499.00
100 LR-19 DPMS Disconnector 2.89 $ 299.00
100 LR-31 DPMS Disconnector Spring 0.49 $ 49.00
100 SF-AP4 Stock Carbine Stock Kit w/Buffer/Spring 48.00 $ 4,800.00
300 VTAC-MK1 Viking Tactics Sling, Original, NSN 1005015344359 21.35 b 6,405.00
1,500 MAG-217 Magpul PMAG, 20 Round Polymer, Black 10.50 $ 15,750.00
2500 CB-M1 Chamber Safe, Orange Plastic Chamber Block 5.00 $ 12,500.00
27 Guardian TS Range Systems - Guardian TS - 394.00 $ 10,638.00
No LIFT Gate service included - Dock Delivery ONLY $ -
[ 4 week delivery on Guardian TS $ -
Quoted By: Terms: Net 30 days TOTAL $ 176,769.50
Jim Rund Freight: Freight included in above pricing
Illinois Anticipated Delivery: 30-45 days ARO



