Specification Number: F2998940012

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

SALVAGE TABULATION

Date: August 6, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG. 1 CarlosAlvarado James Strictly LV Trucking, Derby Hill McCoy Auto Andy’'s Truck Vintage Erickson Auto Ideal AutoEnt. | RichardsAuto
Andriacchi Sewers, Inc. Inc. Equipment Parts& Glass | & Equipment Vehicles & Trucksn-Parts | Wholesalers Inc. Sales
Co. Parts, Inc.
1) A322 X X X NO BID NO BID $150.00 X NO BID X NO BID $179.00 $81.00
2) A344 X $125.00 X $150.00 X X $129.00 X
3) A345 X X X $150.00 X X $169.00 X
4) A351 $20.00 X X $150.00 X X $469.00 $145.00
5) A394 $20.00 $126.00 X $150.00 X X $169.00 $126.00
6) A400 $1,795.95 $125.00 X $150.00 X X $269.00 $60.00
7) A402 $20.00 X X $150.00 X X $469.00 $166.00
8) FM 1176 X X X X X X X X
9) PV0106 X $126.00 X $150.00 X X $1,069.00 $210.00
10) PV2070 X X X X X X X $60.00
11) RV105L X $465.00 $200.00 $150.00 X X X $126.00
12) RV106L X $235.00 $200.00 $150.00 X X $169.00 $76.00
13) RV108L X X $200.00 $150.00 X X $169.00 $135.00
14) RVP949 X $435.00 $200.00 $150.00 X X $569.00 $361.00
15) S3842L X X X $150.00 X X X $30.00
16) S10221 X X X X $1,789.00 $2,811.77 X X




Bid Deposit: $ NONE

Specification Number: F2998940012

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

SALVAGE TABULATION

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Date: August 6, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG. 2 Adeiman’s RKO Auto AAA Dollar WH& Sl Ramon Alvorez llyas T & B Cartage
Truck Parts Sales Disposal Inc.
Corp.
1) A322 X X X NO BID X X X
2) A344 X X X X X X
3) A345 X X X X X X
4) A351 X X X X X X
5) A394 X X X X X X
6) A400 X X X X X X
7) A402 X X X X X X
8) FM 1176 X X X X X $185.58
9) PV0106 X $350.00 X X $668.00 X
10) PV2070 X X X X X $251.66
11) RV105L X X X X $349.90 X
12) RV106L X X X X X X
13) RV108L X $601.00 X $455.00 $349.90 X
14) RVP949 X $769.00 X X $659.00 $435.53
15) S3842L X X X X X $175.93
16) S10221 $2,951.00 X $2,513.00 X X X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer




