

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940006

Date: April 9, 2003

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 1	Tom McIntosh	Vintage Vehicles & Parts Inc.	Richards Auto Sales	Minas Klivas	LV Trucking, Inc.	Auto Wholesalers	Derby Hill Equipment	A-A-A Dollar Disposal, Inc.	Adelman's Truck Parts Corp.	Erickson Trucks-N-Parts	House of Trucks	Andy's Truck & Equipment
1) FM2106		X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	X	\$882.00	X	\$100.00	X
2) HS0107		X							X	X	X	\$100.00	X
3) PV0086		\$439.55							X	X	X	\$50.00	X
4) S10210		X							X	\$3,371.00	\$1,831.11	\$1,230.82	\$1,169.00
5) S10212		X							X	\$2,917.00	\$2,831.11	\$1,127.55	\$1,169.00
6) S10215		X							\$3,413.00	\$2,877.00	\$2,631.11	\$1,230.82	\$1,249.00
7) S10235		X							X	\$2,688.00	\$1,631.11	\$1,230.82	\$1,349.00
8) S10237		X							X	\$2,888.00	\$1,631.11	\$1,330.82	\$1,329.00
9) S10238		X							X	\$3,151.00	\$1,831.11	\$1,330.82	\$1,359.00
10) S10247		X							X	\$2,635.00	\$1,331.11	\$1,330.82	\$1,059.00
11) S12053		X							X	\$1,351.00	\$811.11	\$997.85	\$868.00
12) S13344		X							X	X	X	\$50.00	X
13) S53		X							X	X	X	\$50.00	X
14) 12030		X							X	\$887.00	\$611.11	\$997.00	\$169.00
15) 12035		X							X	\$1,361.00	\$611.11	\$997.00	\$489.00
16) 12040		X							X	\$1,256.00	\$2,261.11	\$997.00	\$689.00
17) 12041		X							X	\$1,472.00	\$1,651.11	\$997.00	\$569.00
18) 12044		X							X	\$1,234.00	\$1,131.11	\$997.00	\$569.00

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940006

Date: April 9, 2003

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 4	Jim Comoy	A&M Auto	Speedy Redi-Mix									
19) 12046		NO BID	X	X									
20) 12048			X	\$2,500.00									
21) 12050			X	X									
22) 12051			X	\$3,150.00									
23) 12054			X	X									

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer